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Company 

Name 
YACHT, a Randstad Company 

Address High Tech Campus 32 5656 AE, Eindhoven 

Number of 

employee 
5000 (1000 engineering) 

Business field Engineering Consultancy  

Home page https://www.yacht.nl/professionals/boost-your-career 

Company 

Introduction 

(English) 

YACHT, a RANDSTAD company 

YACHT leads the way in connecting professionals. We offer challenging projects and jobs 

with inspiring organizations such as Siemens, ASML and Philips and many more. For you, 

joining Yacht will be the start of building a large and powerful network. A network made 

up of professionals just like you with whom you can share knowledge and experiences. 

‘Together, we achieve more’ is our philosophy. 

Randstad is a global leader in recruitment and human resource solutions. Founded in the 

Netherlands in 1960, we are now active in over 40 countries and we employ more than 

29,000 people. We provide employment opportunities for 576,000 people every day.  

 

REAL GROWTH 

We believe that real growth happens in the workplace. That’s why we focus on offering 

you the opportunity to become involved in interesting and challenging projects. You will 

become a member of the Yacht network. And of course you will constantly be working on 

new challenges, so that you will keep your knowledge and skills up-to-date. 

 

WHAT DRIVES YOU? 

Our understanding of what it takes to be professionally successful is second to none. And 

so we know how vital it is to look beyond basic skills requirements and educational 

background. We look at the person underneath. In practical terms, this means that before 

introducing you to one of our clients, we will take into account the factors that motivate 

you, your preferences with respect to an organization’s mission and culture, and – of 

course – your own personal circumstances and interests. 

 

AMBITIOUS PROFESSIONALS 

We are always looking for ambitious professionals. Professionals who are keen to acquire 

the skills that will make them stand out and be among the best in their profession. 

Professionals who actively seek out new challenges. Are you a highly skilled professional in 

the fields of engineering, finance or information technology? Would you like to broaden 

your horizons – both personally and professionally? Then we would like to meet you. 
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Interested 

Major 

☒ Mechanical engineering, ☒ computer science, ☒ electrical engineering, ☐ chemistry, 

☐ industrial engineering, ☐ material science, ☐ bio science, ☐ energy, 

☐ (others:                ) 

Possible Job1 Electronics Designer (Junior/Medior/Senior) 

 
Working within Yacht means working on challenging designer projects at several big 
companies in the Eindhoven region. You will be working on project basis on design projects, 
varying from for example Electrical Layout, Power Electronics, Electrical Safety, Electronic 
cabinets, Motion Systems, highly complex PCB’s (specifications, design and realization & 
qualification) and PLC engineering. While working on these project you are surrounded by a 
multidisciplinary team: Physics, Mechanics, Software and others. The projects vary every 
month and the specific role will be discussed during the intake and afterwards. 
 
Link to FULL vacancy text  
 

Possible Job2 Mechanical Designer (Junior/Medior/Senior) – for (High Tech) Machinery  

 
We are looking for Mechanical Designers who are willing to pioneer, develop themselves 
and other colleagues around them. The Mechanical designer will contribute to the 
development of products; by specification, architecture, design, mechanical calculations 
(a.o. FEM), technical budget analysis, integration and test execution of mechanical 
components or subsystems.  
 
Working as a Mechanical designer at our clients is all about pushing the boundaries. This is 
not ‘copy-and-paste' engineering. You need to be able to innovate. You will make use of 
everything you learned at university, and more, to create completely new solutions on time 
and within budget. You will work within multidisciplinary teams, and have plenty of 
opportunity to learn from highly skilled colleagues. They think ahead to achieve the 
seemingly impossible every day. 
 
Link to FULL vacancy text 
 

Possible Job3 Computer Science / Embedded Software Designer / Integrator /  Tester 
 
Are you a seasoned, talented and motivated embedded software engineer who wants to 
join an Agile group of and embedded developers? You will contribute to leading 
technologies for complex products or systems at high tech clients in the Brainport area in 
and around Eindhoven, The Netherlands. 
  
You will participate in challenging, innovative and multidisciplinary development projects. 
You will be working in a cross-functional team, using proven techniques for improving 
development, yet in a flexible manner, in order to ensure agility for the business to reach its 
shared goals. 
 
Link to FULL vacancy text 

https://bit.ly/2x11qko
https://www.yacht.nl/vacatures/9057033/
https://www.yacht.nl/vacatures/9048855
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Recruiting 

sites 

  

https://bit.ly/2xfRrb5 
 

Video about living and working in the  
Netherlands, our expat team will fully guide you 
 
 

https://bit.ly/2p5G5mf 
 

Yacht Engineering, Focus on engineering  
career opportunities 
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